Ali Parandeh Zandpour

From: Ali Parandeh Zandpour <ali@aliparandeh.com>
Sent: 28 October 2025 08:40

To: 'José Marti'

Subject: RE: 2nd part payment reminder

Good morning Jose,

| know you were in Austria last week, that’s why | didn’t want to bother you on your trip.
Here is the bank account: ES83 1465 0100 9117 0119 9668 (ING Bank) Acocunt name: Ali Parandeh
Look forward to speaking next week

Regards
Ali

From: José Marti [mailto:marticalonge@gmail.com]
Sent: 28 October 2025 06:37

To: Ali Parandeh

Subject: Re: 2nd part payment reminder

Hello Ali!

I hope you are doing well!

Could you please send me the bank account? Thanks

I was in Austria last week, I’'m in Frankfurt and we will restart the classes next week!
Have a nice day!

Best,
Jose

On Mon, 27 Oct 2025 at 08:47, Ali Parandeh <ali@aliparandeh.com> wrote:

Ali Parandeh - CRM

27-10-2025

Good morning Jose

| hope you had a good trip last week. Just circling back to see if you could make the second payment.
Look forward to our journey and your continued growth, in the coming weeks.

Kind regards

Ali
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